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JUICE GOOSE warrants as the only warranty that its products shall display freedom from defects in 
materials and workmanship when operated under normal use and service subject to the “Limitations 
and Conditions” listed below, for THREE YEARS from the date on which the product was 
purchased from a commercial retail business.  If during this warranty period a defect should occur, 
the product may be repaired or replaced at the option of JUICE GOOSE.  This warranty is 
transferable to a repurchaser during the period stated above. See Juice Goose Warranty Claim 
Procedures document for additional warranty terms and information.  
 
Limitations and Conditions:  The above warranty applies to all products of JUICE GOOSE and all 
components thereof with the exception of model JG Junior and any circuit board mounted electronic 
components which shall be warranted for ONE YEAR from the date of the unit manufacture. This 
warranty shall be void if the product is damaged in shipment or use or applied in a manner 
inconsistent with instructions in the owner’s manual or generally accepted good practice.  
 
Any technical advice furnished by Juice Goose regarding use or application of its products is 
furnished without charge and represents good faith and best judgment under the circumstances. 
Such advice is accepted and applied at recipient’s sole risk. 
 
Under no circumstances shall JUICE GOOSE or any person involved in the design, production 
and/or distribution of its products be liable for any damages, including any lost profits, lost savings 
or other direct, indirect, special, incidental or consequential charges even if JUICE GOOSE or an 
authorized JUICE GOOSE reseller has been advised of the possibility of such damage or any claim 
or claims by other parties.  In particular, JUICE GOOSE shall have no liability for any programs or 
data stored in equipment powered by JUICE GOOSE products nor liability for lost revenues related 
directly or indirectly to the operation of JUICE GOOSE products.  
 
JUICE GOOSE does from time to time act as a sales agent or distributor for products manufactured 
by other companies and sold with other brand names. Warranty policies and terms for such 
products are not within the control of JUICE GOOSE and are not covered by the above statement. 
See the actual warranty policy of individual manufacturers for details. 
 
The warranty and remedies set forth above are exclusive and in lieu of all others, oral or written, 
expressed or implied.  No JUICE GOOSE dealer, agent or employee is authorized to make 
modification, extension or addition to this warranty. 
 
See Juice Goose Warranty Claim Procedures document for additional warranty terms and 
information. 
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